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Senior Stewards Report 
 

Name of Track Fort Erie  

Date Sunday, 17 Jun 2018 Post-time 1:20 

Weather Race 1 - 8: Humid (Temp: 29 deg. C)  

Track Conditions  Type: Dirt, Fast Turf: Firm, rail out 18 ft. 

Number of Races 8  

Scratches         Vet: 4 Stewards: 4 Track:   

 

Senior Steward Associate Steward Associate Steward 

Fenton Platts Pete Gillies Brian Arrand 

 
Report on day’s Events: (Backstretch - accidents, fines, suspensions, objections, disqualifications, refunds, pertinent incidents, 

general details etc., Film Reviews, Races, Claims) 

 

Backstretch:  

 
Race office informed that Apprentice Jockey Daisuke Fukumoto not riding here today, has 
commitments at Woodbine. Spoke with Daisuke Fukomotos' Jockey Agent, Pram Seebah, we 
accepted that Fukumoto to be dismissed from his mounts today. We asked that in the future that 
he inform the Ft. Erie Race Office of the decision which track his riders are to participate prior to 
the program for that day goes to print to late changes. He understood and will call race office on 
Friday before program going to print. 
 
Spoke with Pat Parente regarding the horse Man Crush. Dr. Starmer had assessed this horse as 
sound and in good health for racing. The previous owner, Chad Joe, refused to facilitate the foal 
certificate to new owner Judith Adams until his concerns of health and soundness with the horse 
were satisfied. Forwarded an e-mail detailing same to Pat Parente to forward to the previous 
owner. A bill of sale to accompany the foal certificate. 
 
Review: Trainer Nicola Wells-Scott. Investigator report #18-204, misconduct, use of unlicensed 
veterinarian. Decision reserved. 
 
Review: Owner/Trainer Robert Warner. Investigator report #18-163, misconduct, use of 
unlicensed veterinarian. Decision reserved. 
 

  

  



 

Film Reviews: 
                                         
None 

 

Races:                                                             REVISED 

58 in to go 
 
Race 1, Turf, #3 A Bit of Who Do bore out at start, rest clear. 
 
Race 2, clear. Urging caution to Jockey Krista Carignan, raising hand above head level when 
urging. 
 
Race 3, Turf, #1 was slow and stumbled, rest ok 
 
Race 4, Stewards Inquiry, #6 Brady O’Brady stumbled mid backstretch unseating Apprentice 
Jockey Jennifer Fielding. No interference no change to order.  
 
 
Stewards’ Inquiry video: https://youtu.be/98hg6e3wosM  
 
 
 
Race 5, Turf, Jockey claim of Foul, #3 Cape Mist, 4th, M. Pinto on #8 Adopted Family, 1st, Ademar 
Santos, the run into the first turn. Upon review #8 appears to be leaving enough room for the 
inside. M. Pinto felt he did not leave enough room and had to check. A. Santos said he was 
looking to the inside and stayed out. The Stewards disallowed the claim of foul. No change to the 
order of finish. Ademar Santos issued a notice of review for urging. Raising hand above head 
height while urging. 
 
Claim of foul video:  https://youtu.be/uXoC06XWKQ8  
 
Race 6, clear. Tony Maragh issued a notice of review for urging. Raising hand above head height 
while urging. 
 
Race 7, clear. 
 
Race 8, Turf, #1 Ave Caeser through his head up at start, rest clear 
 
Mutuels: $3.30 $2.40 $2.30                              Handle: $591,584. 

 

Claims: 
 
Race 4, #3 Gasparilla Trove for $4,500. By Gerard Catalno and Victor Gnozzo/Tr. Anthony 
Adamo 
 
Race 8, #9 Hampstead Heath for $12,500. By Joey Gee Thoroughbreds/Tr. Jim Ensom 

https://youtu.be/98hg6e3wosM
https://youtu.be/uXoC06XWKQ8


 

 


