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Senior Stewards Report 
 

Name of Track Woodbine  

Date Saturday, 8 Jun 2019 Post-time 1:05 

Weather Race 1 - 11: Clear (Temp: 24 deg. C)  

Track Conditions  Type: Tapeta Turf: Firm   Lane 1 

Number of Races 11    116 entered  

Scratches         Vet: 1 Stewards: 3 Track:   

 

Senior Steward Associate Steward Associate Steward 

Gunnar Lindberg Fenton Platts John Dorion 

 
Report on day’s Events: (Backstretch - accidents, fines, suspensions, objections, disqualifications, refunds, pertinent incidents, 

general details etc., Film Reviews, Races, Claims) 

 

Office:  

09:50 – Jockey Neil Wilson attended and was upset that Jockey Skye Chernetz was placed on 
Justin Nixon’s horse “Patton’s Girl” in today’s fourth race. Skye was not at the draw on 
Wednesday and was named on two horses. The Steward on duty made the call to place her on 
the horse of trainer Jordan Lay. After the draw was over, Trainer Justin Nixon called to complain 
Skye should be on his horse as he had first call and she has been galloping the horse. We also 
received a call from Skye to say Justin did have the call and Mr. Lay just named her on, didn’t 
know he was going in the race. We made the change to put Skye on the horse and Mr. Wilson 
was upset that we removed his rider after being listed in the program. Spoke to Justin Nixon and 
he was pleased with the outcome.  
 
10:30 – Jockey Oral Dean Stimpson attended re: disrespectful by word towards the official 
Outriders, monetary penalty of $200.00 
 
 

Film Reviews: 

 

Races: 

  

  



 
Race 1 – Clear 
 
Race 2 – #6 “Dance Along Dede” ridden by Alan Garcia was away slow 
 
Race 3 – Stewards Inquiry re: Run into the far turn involving #3 “Count Forest” with Jesse 
Campbell aboard who checks his horse. Jesse said his horse doesn’t like to be in tight quarters 
and when Kazushi came up to my inside my horse didn’t want to be in there. Had an issue in a 
race last year. Jesse did feel however, that Kazushi on #1 “Salieri” got up inside him late. Kazushi 
said he let his horse go up along the rail but never came off it or bothered anyone. Rafael 
Hernandez aboard #2 “Executive Sight” was behind and to the outside and thought from his 
vantage point, Kazushi should not have run up the inside. Patrick Husbands on #5 “Sailing Home” 
and on the outside of Campbell said he held his ground and stayed off Jesse. After review the 
video didn’t support the need for a placing. No Change.  
 
Video review: https://youtu.be/s9XBiNBwa3c  
 
Race 4 – Clear 
 
Race 5 – Clear 
 
Race 6 – The William D. Graham Memorial” - Clear 
 
Race 7 – Stewards Inquiry and rider Claim of Foul by Michelle Rainford aboard #6 “Get My Gist” 
against #3 “Epilogue” ridden by Justin Stein for interference through the stretch. Michelle said she 
was going straight and had a real chance to win when Justin came out and bumped he hard, 
moved us out, believe it cost me the win. Justin said Michelle’s horse was lugging in on him 
around the turn and we did come together a bit during the stretch run, but I was going by her. 
After review, we disqualified #3 “Epilogue” from first and placed it second behind #6 “Get My 
Gist”.  
 
Video review: https://youtu.be/pFyQA4AFBT8   
 
Race 8 – The Plate Trial Stakes – Review of an incident down the backstretch in the vicinity of 
the ½ mile pole involving #2 “Rising Star” ridden by Justin Stein and #9 “Krachenwagen” ridden 
by Jeffrey Alderson. Justin said he was in there but his horse didn’t “quicken” the way I wanted 
him to. He did squeeze me a bit but wasn’t too worried. Jeffrey said he didn’t realize Justin was 
inside him until he yelled, pulled out off him. Video review scheduled for tomorrow. 
 
Video review: https://youtu.be/9xlMTHNgiqA  
 
Race 9 – The Woodbine Oaks – Clear 
 
Race 10 – Clear 
 
Race 11 - #9 “Last Sunrise” ridden by Rafael Hernandez was a vet scratch at the gate. Clear  
 
 
Mutuel payout last race winner $4.60  $3.10  $2..90           Handle $8,264,793 
 

Claims: 

 

https://youtu.be/s9XBiNBwa3c
https://youtu.be/pFyQA4AFBT8
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