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Senior Judges Report 
 

Name of Track      Rideau Carleton Ottawa 

Date     Thursday 25 July 2019 Post Time 18:30 

Weather   Race 1 - 10: Clear (Temp: 27 deg. C) 

Track Condition Race 1 - 10: Fast (Variant 0 secs)   

Number of Races 10 Qualifying races   Total Entries  75/87 

Mutual Handle $97,653 

Contact  
Vet     

  Paddock 
Meeting 

  Track  
Maintenance Meeting 

  Investigator  
Visit 

  Outgoing Senior  
Judge Update 

  

 

Senior Judge Associate Judge Associate Judge 

Weber, Michael Coles, Sharla Frenette, Ben 

Report on day’s events:  

(Accidents, claims, fines and/or suspensions, objections and/or disqualifications, refunds and any other pertinent incidents)  …. 

Office: 

 No reviews or other issues this evening.  

Races: 

 Lengthy delays posting the official results for the first two races as the tote board has 
been decommissioned and the order of finish must be posted on the television monitors 
causing the graphics system to crash.  

1. Clear.  

2. Late Judges scratch (ineligible; owner not licenced) of STPATTYSDAY, refund: $101. 
Clear.  

3. Clear.  

4. Driver of #4 TOPVILLE CHROME, Gilles Gendron, cautioned regarding his urging in 
the stretch. Clear.  

5. Inquiry on #1 HP PANDORA (Marie-Claude Auger) who finished 2nd and #3 OLIVIA V 
(Pascal Berube) who finished 1st concerning possible interference at the ¾ mile pole; 
after speaking with both drivers (Mr. Berube stated his horse beared in and brushed the 
wheel of #1; Ms. Auger stated she was not impeded) and reviewing the video there was 
no placing; no penalty to Mr. Berube as the horse was clearly bearing in. Clear.  

Video: https://youtu.be/a_IBl3nEBHo  

6. Late Vet scratch (sick) of #8 WINGS OF BALLYKEEL by the trainer (Sylvia Toth), 
refund: $38. Recall as #1 TIME TO TRAVEL (Gilles Gendron) broke before the start 
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and did cause interference to #9 MASSMADE and #3 STONEBRIDGE HALL. RAISING 
RICHARD suffered broken equipment (knee boot) after the start and finished with 
broken equipment. Clear. 

7. Clear.  

8. Clear.  

9. Clear.  

10. Breathalyzer retest. Inquiry on #5 SHYTOWN SHADOW (Emil Toth) after the start 
concerning possible interference on #6 QUEENJANE BLUECHIP (Claude Larose) and 
#9 THRILLING TIMES (Marie-Claude Auger); after speaking with the drivers and 
reviewing the video it was determined that #5 did bear down causing interference to #6 
and #9; #5 finished 8th and was placed 9th (AGCO rule 22.09). Mr. Toth will attend the 
Judges office for a review of this race. Clear.  

Video: https://youtu.be/tivFy64PBD8  

Claims: 

 5 #1 HP PANDORA (1 claim) for $8,750 by Matthew McDonald, Brent Campbell 
(claiming certificate #13254), Gino Bilodeau & Anne-Marie Demers (M. McDonald 
trainer).  

 7 #4 BADSTORMANYPORT (1 claim) for $7,000 by Jean-Roch Marois (Gerard Demers 
trainer).  
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